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is printed on demand. Paperback. 156 pages. Dimensions: 9.7in.
x 7.4in. x 0.3in.This historic book may have numerous typos
and missing text. Purchasers can download a free scanned
copy of the original book (without typos) from the publisher.
Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1848. Excerpt: . . . SUMMARY.
General statement of the evil of a Logical Theology--The
Church sanctions the use of Logic only as an art of defence--
Platonism the established Philosophy of the Church--An art of
Logic indispensable to the speculating Christian in the West--
Division of the Sciences in the middle age--Tendency of the age
to blend all into a metaphysical Logic, or Dialectic--Logic
perverted into a Science of Investigation--Obstructions to the
real improvement of Logic--Ignorance of Aristotles writings in
themselves--Importance of the writings of Boethius--Effect of
the Crusades in opening fresh sources of knowledge--Progress
of Scholasticism illustrated in the division of parties into
Nominalists and Realists--Triumph of Realism--Realism, the
scientific basis of Scholasticism--Nominalism the resource of
the more liberal speculators--Opposition between Duns Scotus,
and Ockam--Ascendancy of a Logical Philosophy evidenced in
the subsequent state of knowledge. Theology erected into an
exact demonstrative Science--its Principles drawn from the
incomprehensible nature...
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